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Demand Neuware - Essay from the year 2004 in the subject
Environmental Sciences, grade: HD, Murdoch University (ISTP -
Institute for Sustainability and Technology Policy), course:
Ecology, Society, and Human Health, 31 entries in the
bibliography, language: English, comment: This essay examines
the mentioned connectedness of human behaviour and the
natural world. More specifically, it deals with the global issue of
human induced climate change and its impacts on ecological
health (3) and human health (4), focusing on Germany.
Following on from this, global and German mitigation policies
are introduced and the health benefits are outlined (5). The
starting point marks a brief discussion of the link between
greenhouse gases and climate change (2). + viel Literatur ,
abstract: In these days, global climatic changes that can be
observed are rooted in human activities. The prevailing carbon-
based economy makes issues like heating and electricity,
population growth and industrialisation, transportation and
mobility, over-consumption and globalisation the main
contributors of emission of greenhouse gases, with the
consequence (among others) of global warming, and thus a
changing climate. These global changes have...
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